
Students Administration Interaction Meetings (SAIM)     

Students can bring academic issues to the notice of the administration during the meetings with Chairs of the 
Departments (CoD). For discussing administrative issues other than academic matters, a Student 
Administration Interaction Meeting (SAIM) will be held once in a quarter. The Students’ Council will 
represent the students in these meetings. 
 
Sexual Harassment Prevention and Prohibition Policy  

Pursuant to the Sexual Harassment of Women at Workplace (Prevention, Prohibition and Redressal) Act, 
2013, Sexual Harassment of Women at Workplace Rules, 2013, and UGC Regulations on Sexual 
Harassment Prevention and Prohibition, the Institute has come out with its own policy on Sexual 
Harassment Prevention and Prohibition. This policy may be accessed at http://www.iisc.ac.in/policies 
 
New Medical Officer at the Health Centre 

Dr. Neethi Ravindran has been appointed as Medical Officer in the Health Centre with effect from 17th 
May, 2017. She was Assistant Surgeon for over 3 years in the Department of Health Service, Government 
of Kerala, before her appointment in the Institute. With her appointment, the Health Centre has 5 regular 
doctors, apart from consultants in the following specialities: Gynaecology, ENT, Dentistry, Dermatology, 
Psychiatry, Ophthalmology and Radiology. 
 
Admissions 2017 

Admissions for the year 2017 have been completed smoothly, with 944 students admitted to various 
courses. As on date, the break-up of students for various courses is as follows: Bachelor of Science 
(Research) – 106, M. Des. – 28, M. Mgt. – 16, M. Tech. – 332, M. Tech. (Res) – 54, PhD (Engg) – 213, 
PhD (Sci) – 139 and Int. PhD – 56.  
  
Summer Fellowship Programme for SC/ST students 

The Summer Fellowship Programme in Science and Engineering for SC/ST students was conducted 
between June 12 and July 11, 2017. 53 students from all over the country participated in the programme. 
The students were assigned to several faculty members in science and engineering.  
 
Re-organisation of administrative responsibilities 

For better administrative efficiency, the Institute administration has been re-organised as follows:  
 
Units under the Registrar: Council Section, Establishment and Evaluation Section, Students and Guest 
Housing, Centre for Sponsored Schemes and Projects, Security and Fire Fighting, Official Language Unit, 
Office of Legal Affairs and Office of Public Relations. 
 
Units under the Joint Registrar: Academic section including Undergraduate studies, Purchase & Stores 
and CCMD.  
 
In CCMD, the JR will be in charge of the maintenance and service cell, campus upkeep & maintenance, 
water management, campus services unit and garden and nursery, while the planning and execution of 
building projects and planning, execution and maintenance of electrical and water grid will be managed by 
the Project Engineer and Estate Officer.  
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